

**CHEMUNG COUNTY/ CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPT**  
**RFB-1992 Refuse & Recyclable Materials Collections**  
**for Chemung County Departments**

Bid Opening: October 19, 2017

		<b>Bidder</b>	<b>Casella Waste Systems</b>	<b>Swarthout Recycling</b>	
		<b>Surety 5%</b>	<b>Bid Bond</b>	<b>N/A</b>	
		<b>Addendum 1</b>	<b>Received</b>	<b>N/A</b>	
<b>Location</b>	<b>Container</b>	<b>Tentative Schedule 2018 - 2019</b>			
<b>#1</b>	20 Yd. Compactor	On Call January - December (12 mo.)	Monthly Rental per Unit (x12)	<b>\$250.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Jail			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$3,000.00</b>	
			Haul Fee	<b>\$220.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#2</b>	30 Yd. Open	On Call May - October (6 mo.)	Monthly Rental per Unit (x6)	<b>\$60.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Harris Hill			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$360.00</b>	
			Haul Fee	<b>\$205.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#3</b>	6 Yd.	Monthly January - December (12 mo.) Bi-Weekly Pick up: Friday	Monthly Rental per Unit (x12)	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Harris Hill			Monthly Pick up Fee (x26)	<b>\$58.00</b>	
			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$1,508.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#4</b>	30 Yd. Open	On Call April - October (7 mo.)	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x7)	<b>\$60.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Park Station			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$420.00</b>	
			Haul Fee	<b>\$225.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#5</b>	6 Yd.	On Call November - March (5 mo.)	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x5)	<b>\$15.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Park Station			Pick up Fee	<b>\$45.00</b>	
			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$75.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#6</b>	30 Yd. Compactor	On Call January - December (12 mo.)	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x12)	<b>\$350.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Nursing Facility			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$4,200.00</b>	
			Haul Fee	<b>\$150.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#7</b>	8 Yd. Cardboard Receptacle	January - December (12 mo.) Twice Weekly Tuesday and Friday Pick up	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x12)	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Health Center			Pick up Fee (x104)	<b>\$16,730.7</b>	
			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$1,740.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	

**CHEMUNG COUNTY/ CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPT**  
**RFB-1992 Refuse & Recyclable Materials Collections**  
**for Chemung County Departments**

Bid Opening: October 19, 2017

		<b>Bidder</b>	<b>Casella Waste Systems</b>	<b>Swarthout Recycling</b>	
		<b>Surety 5%</b>	<b>Bid Bond</b>	<b>N/A</b>	
		<b>Addendum 1</b>	<b>Received</b>	<b>N/A</b>	
<b>Location</b>	<b>Container</b>	<b>Tentative Schedule 2018 - 2019</b>			
<b>#8</b>	Two (2) Each 95 Gal. White Paper Junk Mail	January - December (12 mo.) Twice Weekly Tuesday and Friday Pick up	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x24)	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Health Center			Pick Up Fee (x208)	<b>\$2.76923</b>	
			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$576.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#9</b>	Seven (7) Each 95 Gal. Glass Plastic Tin	January - December (12 mo.) Twice Weekly Tuesday and Friday Pick up	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x84)	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Health Center			Pick up Fee (x728)	<b>\$2.76923</b>	
			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$2,016.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#10</b>	6 Yd. Trash Receptacle	January - December (12 mo.) Weekly Pick up Wednesday	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x12)	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Public Works			Pick up Fee (x52)	<b>\$28.84615</b>	
			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$1,500.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#11</b>	20 Yd. C & D	On Call January - December (12 mo.)	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x12)	<b>\$60.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Airport			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$720.00</b>	
			Haul Fee	<b>\$220.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#12</b>	Four (4) Each 95 Gal. White Paper Junk Mail Recyclables	January - December (12 mo.) Weekly Pick up Wednesday	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x48)	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Airport			Pick up Fee (x208)	<b>\$2.76923</b>	
			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$576.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#13</b>	30 Yd. Compactor	On Call January - December (12 mo.) After Construction Ends September 2018	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x12)	<b>\$500.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Airport			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$6,000.00</b>	
			Haul Fee	<b>\$200.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>Refurb unit, any modifications needed will be billed to the Airport</b>	
<b>#14</b>	20 Yd. Closed Top	On Call January - December (12 mo.) During Construction	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x12)	<b>\$90.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
Airport			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$1,080.00</b>	
			Haul Fee	<b>\$200.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	

**CHEMUNG COUNTY/ CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPT**  
**RFB-1992 Refuse & Recyclable Materials Collections**  
**for Chemung County Departments**

Bid Opening: October 19, 2017

		<b>Bidder</b>	<b>Casella Waste Systems</b>	<b>Swarthout Recycling</b>	
		<b>Surety 5%</b>	<b>Bid Bond</b>	<b>N/A</b>	
		<b>Addendum 1</b>	<b>Received</b>	<b>N/A</b>	
<b>Location</b>	<b>Container</b>	<b>Tentative Schedule 2018 - 2019</b>			
<b>#15</b>	6 Yd. Cardboard	On Call January - December (12 mo.)	Monthly Rental per Unit (x12)	<b>\$15.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
<b>Airport</b>			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$180.00</b>	
			Pick up Fee	<b>\$26.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#16</b>	30 Yd. Open	On Call January - December (12 mo.)	Monthly Rental per Unit (x12)	<b>\$100.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
<b>EMO Lattabrook Rd.</b>			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$1,200.00</b>	
			Haul Fee	<b>\$200.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>#17</b>	Two (2) 6 Yd. Trash Receptacles	January - December (12 mo.) Weekly Pick up Wednesday	Monthly Rental Per Unit (x24)	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
<b>Sewer District</b>			Pick Up Fee (x104)	<b>\$20.76923</b>	
			Total Annual Cost	<b>\$2,160.00</b>	
			Additional Fees	<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>Annual Total Gross Sum of Unit Bid Prices</b>			<b>\$27,311.00</b>	<b>N/A</b>	