

**CHEMUNG COUNTY-CITY OF ELMIRA PURCHASING DEPARTMENT**  
**RFB-1998 Chemical Storage and Feed Upgrade Sewer District #1**

Bid Opening: January 25, 2018

Bidder	Matco Electric Corporation	John Mills Electric, Inc	Kimble, Inc	Elmira Structures, Inc
<b>Surety</b>	<b>Bid Bond</b>	<b>Bid Bond</b>	<b>Bid Bond</b>	<b>Bid Bond</b>
<b>Addendum 1</b>	Received	Received	Received	Received
<b>Contract 1 General</b>				
A-1 Mobilization General	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	\$25,000.00
A-2 General Construction Base Bid				\$303,000.00
A-3 Record Documents General				\$5,000.00
A-4 Dewatering Building Storage Room (Add Alt #1)				\$140,000.00
A-5 Dewatering Building Canopy				\$85,000.00
<b>Contract 1 General Total Bid Price</b>				<b>\$558,000.00</b>
<b>Contract 2 Electrical</b>				
A-6 Mobilization Electrical	\$3,100.00	\$2,500.00	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
A-7 Electrical Construction	\$58,200.00	\$70,900.00		
A-8 Record Documents Electrical	\$1,000.00	\$5,000.00		
A-9 Dewatering Building Storage Room (Add Alt #1)	\$8,050.00	\$7,600.00		
<b>Contract 2 Electrical Total Bid Price</b>	<b>\$70,350.00</b>	<b>\$86,000.00</b>		
<b>Contract 3 Plumbing</b>				
A-10 Mobilization Plumbing	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	\$5,200.00	<b>No Bid</b>
A-11 Plumbing Construction			\$97,800.00	
A-12 Record Documents Plumbing			\$1,000.00	
<b>Contract 3 Plumbing Total Bid Price</b>				