

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

General Comments on Use of Bid Awards:

Bids are awarded as stated on the following sheets. Please take notice of comments and conditions for award.

All bids were awarded on the basis of the lowest bidder meeting all specifications, unless otherwise noted. Should any municipality or agency require a copy of the specification for any item please contact the Public Works Office. Please note that all asphalt related items have escalation and de-escalation clauses in the specifications and actual prices may differ from bid sheet at time of purchase.

Please note that all successful bidders for Public Works contracts (but generally not materials contracts) are required to furnish the contracting municipality with a surety and payment bond in the amount of 100% of the specific work requested by the contract. The successful bidder is also required to procure insurance of at least \$1,000,000 per occurrence, naming the contracting municipality as an additional insured. Please refer to the appropriate bid specification for further details.

TABLE OF CONTENTS

ITEM	RFB #	PAGE
Aggregates		
Airport Grade De-Icing Sand	#1763	3
Highway Deicing Sand	#1767	3
Crushed Gravel	#1796	4
Crushed Limestone	#1797	4
Heavy Stone Rip Rap Filling	#1766	5
Coarse Aggregates	#1820	6
Concrete		
Asphalt Concrete Curbs	#1812	5
Concrete Sidewalks and Driveways	#1813	5
Ready Mix Concrete	#1751	7
Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe	OGS	7
Steel-Galvanized Railing	#1768	7-8
Clear Span Steel Arch	#1832	9
Infrastructure Construction Services	#1819	10
Pavement		
Hot Mix Asphalt FOB	#1801	11
Hot Mix -Municipal	#1800	12-13
Pavement Maintenance		
Cold Mix Bituminous	#1802	14
Liquid Bituminous Materials	#1803	15
Quick Set Slurry Seal	#1804	16
Cold Milling and Micro Milling	#1805	16
Cold Reclamation/Recycling of Pavements	#1814	17
Precast Drainage Units	#1749	18
Precast Structural Units	#1750	19
PVC- In-Line Drainage Units	#1810	19
Rock Salt	OGS	19
Steel Plate and Shapes	#1798	20
Traffic Markings Re-Bid	#1807R	21
Animal Carcass Removal and Disposal	#1809	21
Tree and Stump Removal	#1808	22
Geotextile Material	#1830	23-24

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

TABLE OF CONTENTS FLEET BID AWARDS

ITEM	RFB #	PAGE
Highway Fuel	#1811	25
Fuel Equipment and Service	#1815	25
One 2015 New and Unused Double Drum Vibratory Compactor	#1816	26
New, 2015 Unused Dump Bodies, Plow Equipment and Spreader Controls	#1824	26
Supply Tires and Related Tire Services	#1656	26
Medium & Heavy Duty Vehicle Replacement Parts	#1739	27

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

AIRPORT GRADE DE-ICING SAND

RFB 1763

EXTENDED FROM 2014

DALRYMPLE GRAVEL & CONTRACTING CO. INC

2105 S. Broadway
Pine City, NY 14871
Phone: 737-6200
Fax: 737-1056

Delivered to Airport vehicles @ plant \$99.00/ton
Loaded on municipal vehicles @ plant 5% discount

HIGHWAY DE-ICING SAND

RFB 1767

EXTENDED FROM 2014

**F.S. Lopke
Contracting, Inc.**

3430 S/R 434
Apalachin, NY 13732
Phone: 687-1114
Fax: 687-1856

**Dalrymple Gravel
& Contracting Co.**

2105 S. Broadway
Pine City, NY 14871
Phone: 737-6200
Fax: 737-1056

DELIVERED TO:**

CHEMUNG CO. HIGHWAY	\$15.50	\$16.00
TOWN OF ASHLAND	\$15.00	\$14.50
TOWN OF BALDWIN	\$15.00	\$14.50
TOWN OF BIG FLATS	\$15.75	\$16.00
TOWN OF CATLIN	\$16.95	\$17.00
TOWN OF CHEMUNG	\$14.50	\$14.50
TOWN OF ELMIRA	\$15.50	\$16.00
TOWN OF ERIN	\$15.75	\$17.00
TOWN OF HORSEHEADS	\$15.50	\$16.00
TOWN OF SOUTHPORT	\$16.50	\$16.00
TOWN OF VAN ETTEN	\$15.00	\$17.00
TOWN OF VETERAN	\$16.00	\$16.00
VILLAGE OF ELMIRA HEIGHTS	\$15.75	\$16.00
CITY OF ELMIRA DPS BUILDING	\$15.40	\$16.00

*Both vendors – use haul distance formula

**Both vendors – varies on delivery point

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

CRUSHED GRAVEL

RFB 1796

The municipality purchasing the item or items shall determine Low Bidder for crushed gravel items. The bid price listed shall be added to the calculation for hauling at \$.50 per ton-mile. The lowest total cost will indicate the true low bid.

The other consideration is quality of product. If the bidder's product does not exceed the minimum specifications for the particular item, then the purchaser may use the bidder with the next lowest cost that does exceed the specifications.

Bothar Const.	Dalrymple	Hanson Aggr.	Lopke Contracting	Porter's Concrete
170 E. Service Rd Binghamton, NY 13901 Ph: 723-5012 Fx: 723-4982	2105 S. Broadway Pine City, NY 14871 Ph: 737-6200 Fx: 737-1056	P.O. Box 513 Jamesville, NY 13078 Ph: 315-469-5501 Fx 315-469-3133	3430 S/R 434 Apalachin, NY 13732 Ph: 687-1114 Fx: 687-1856	P.O. Box 390 Waverly, NY 14892 Ph: 565-2452 Fx: 565-8670

PRICE PER TON: - F.O.B. PLANT

1) NYS #1B	\$11.00	N/B	\$11.50	\$13.50	N/B
2) NYS #1A	\$10.75	\$13.95	\$12.50	\$13.50	\$13.55
3) NYS #1 ST	\$11.25	\$13.95	\$12.00	\$13.50	\$13.55
4) NYS #1	\$10.50	\$12.75	\$11.75	\$11.50	\$13.25
5) NYS #2	\$11.75	\$12.70	\$11.75	\$11.50	\$13.00
6) NYS #1 (50%) & NYS #2 (50%)	\$11.00	\$12.70	\$11.75	\$12.00	\$13.25
7) PA #2B	\$10.75	\$12.70	N/B	\$12.00	\$13.00
8) PA #2B (70%) & NYS #1A (30%)	\$11.25	\$12.70	N/B	\$12.00	\$13.50
9) COURSE SAND**	N/B	\$12.70	N/B	\$11.50	N/B
10) 100% CRACKED STONE	N/B	\$13.95	N/B	N/B	N/B
11) CHEMUNG COUNTY 1ST	N/B	\$13.95	N/B	N/B	N/B
12) BANK RUN GRAVEL	\$6.50	\$8.00	N/B	\$7.50	\$6.80
13) SCREENED BANK RUN (2" Stone Max)	\$8.00	\$9.50	N/B	\$8.00	\$8.80

CRUSHED LIMESTONE

RFB 1797

SENECA STONE CORPORATION

2105 S. BROADWAY
PINE CITY, NY 14871
Phone: 315-549-8253
Fax: 315-549-7156

	F.O.B. PLANT	DELIVERED
NYS #1B	\$10.50	\$25.25
NYS#1A	\$12.75/TON	\$27.50
NYS#1	\$12.00	\$26.75
NYS #1ST	\$12.00	\$26.75
NYS #2	\$12.00	\$26.75
NYS #3A	\$12.00	\$26.75
#1&2 MIXED	\$12.00	\$26.75
CRUSHER RUN	\$8.00	\$22.75
LIMESTONE DUST (SCREENINGS)	\$12.00	\$26.75

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

HEAVY STONE RIP RAP FILLING

RFB 1766

EXTENDED FROM 2014

HANSON AGGREGATES

P.O. Box 513
Jamesville, NY 13078
Phone: 315-469-5501
Fax: 315-469-3133

MARCUS COLE

91 N. Main St.
Nichols, NY 13812
Phone: 699-3644
Fax: 699-3404

LOPKE CONTRACTING

3430 S/R 434
Apalachin, NY 13732
Phone: 687-1114
Fax: 687-1856

SENECA STONE

2105 S Broadway
Pine City, NY 14871
Phone: 315-549-8253
Fax: 315-549-7156

Estimated Tons Per Load	30	20 - 22	20	28 - 30
Unit Price/Ton – Slope Work	\$16.00	\$25.75	\$28.50	\$30.25
Dimensional Rip Rap (Stacking &Pinning)	\$45.00	\$27.75	\$34.00	\$35.50
Gabion Stone 4" Min 8" Max Longitudinal Peaked Stone	\$13.00	\$19.00	\$23.50	\$26.25

ASPHALT CONCRETE CURBS

RFB 1812

SENECA PAVING Co., Inc.

184 Ovid St.
Seneca Falls, NY 13148
(315) 568-5640
(315) 568-5516 (fax)

ITEM	In-place asphalt concrete curb	Remove and Replace asphalt concrete curb
	PER LF	PER LF
	\$14.00	\$22.00

CONCRETE SIDEWALKS & DRIVEWAYS

RFB 1813

WENZEL CONTRACTING

170 Prescott Ave
Elmira Heights, NY 14903
Phone: 607-733-8180
Fax: 607-733-8192

<u>ITEM DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>PRICE PER TON</u>
CC8.20 Concrete Sidewalk & Driveway	\$108.00 (SY)
CC8.21 Concrete Stairs	\$1,080.00 (CY)
CC8.22 Miscellaneous Concrete Flatwork	\$128.00 (SY)
CC8.23 Asphalt Concrete Pavement	\$118.00 (SY)

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

COARSE AGGREGATES

RFB 1820

Bidders:											
		TMT Gravel & Contracting 8792 Rte. 549 Millerton, PA 16936 Phone: 570-537-2637		Porters Concrete Svcs. P.O. Box 390 Waverly, NY 14892 Ph: 607-565-2452		Lopke Contracting 3430S/R434 Apalachin, NY 13732 Ph: 607-687-1114		Seneca Stone Corp. P.O. Box 76 Fayette, NY 13065		Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting 2105 South Broadway Pine City, NY 14871 Phone: 607-737-6200	
Item No.	Size	Per Ton FOB Vendor Plant	Per Ton Delivered to Chemung County DPW or Location within Chemung County	Per Ton FOB Vendor Plant	Per Ton Delivered to Chemung County DPW or Location within Chemung County	Per Ton FOB Vendor Plant	Per Ton Delivered to Chemung County DPW or Location within Chemung County	Per Ton FOB Vendor Plant	Per Ton Delivered to Chemung County DPW or Location within Chemung County	Per Ton FOB Vendor Plant	Per Ton Delivered to Chemung County DPW or Location within Chemung County
CA1	AASHTO #57 (#1 & #2 mix)	\$11.50	\$18.75	\$12.65	\$17.40	\$10.50	\$20.50	\$12.00	\$26.75	\$12.70	No Bid
CA2	#2 Crushed (NYSDOT 703.02): (9/16" to 1 1/8")	\$11.50	\$18.75	\$12.65	\$17.40	\$11.50	\$21.50	\$12.00	26.00*	\$12.70	No Bid
CA3	Crusher Run (1 1/2-inch minus) (NYSDOT 304.12):	\$7.50	\$15.25	\$9.25	\$14.00	\$7.50	\$17.50	\$8.00	\$22.75	No Bid	No Bid
HS1	Heavy Stone Fill (NYSDOT 620.05): Blasted	\$16.00	\$24.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.50	\$28.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Source of Material:	TMT Gravel & Contracting Inc. 8792 Rt. 549, Millerton, PA 16936		Pompas Pit 138 SR224, VanEtten, NY		Wysox Quarry, PA Birchardville, PA		2747 County Rd 121 Fayette, NY		Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting Chemung NY & Coopers	
	Place of Manufacture if Different from Source:			88 Porter's Simmental Ln - Main Plant, Waverly, NY				Delivered by trailers to a stockpile			

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

READY MIX CONCRETE

RFB 1751

EXTENDED FROM 2014

HANSON AGGREGATES NY
6895 Ellicott St.
Pavilion, NY 14525
Phone: 585-584-3132
Fax: 585-584-8743

CUSTOM MIX CONCRETE INC
1229 Lowman Rd.
Lowman, NY 14861
Phone: 607-737-0281
Fax: 607-737-0349

(Depends on availability and haul distance from plant)

<u>ITEM/DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>UNIT</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>
NYS Class-A General Purpose	CY	\$110.00	N/B
NYS Class-D Thin Structural	CY	\$118.00	N/B
NYS Class-E Structural Slabs	CY	\$118.00	N/B
NYS Class-F High Early	CY	\$125.00	N/B
NYS Class-HP Exposure to Chlorides	CY	\$135.00	N/B
Alternate – 2,000 psi	CY	\$98.50	\$87.00
Alternate – 2,500 psi	CY	\$98.50	\$88.00
Alternate – 3,000	CY	\$105.00	\$89.50
Alternate – 3,500	CY	\$110.00	\$91.50
Alternate – 4,000 (Structural)	CY	\$115.00	\$94.50
Alternate – 4,500	CY	\$120.00	\$96.50
Alternate – 5,000	CY	\$120.00	\$98.50
(CLSM)-Flowable Fill (50-100 psi)	CY	\$75.00	\$72.00
(CLSM)-Flowable Fill (100-200 psi)	CY	\$80.00	\$74.00
(CLSM)-Flowable Fill (200-300 psi)	CY	\$85.00	\$76.00
Additional for High/Early	CY	\$12.00	\$7.50
Additional for Heat	CY	\$11.50	\$7.00
Additional for Conveyor	HR	\$175.00/per hr.	\$17.00 per CY
Additional Delivery Charge under 3 CY	LS	\$50.00/load	\$70.00/load
 Location	 101 6 th St. Holding Point Horseheads, NY 14845		 Lowman, NY Chemung, NY Coopers Plains, NY

CORRUGATED POLYETHYLENE PIPE NEW YORK STATE BID AWARD #PC59995 - GROUP 37702

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORPORATION - (ADS)
PO BOX 527
ELMIRA, NY 14902
PHONE: 733-5506
FAX: 732-5379

STEEL- GALVANIZED RAILING

RFB 1768

EXTENDED FROM 2014

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORPORATION PRICE THE SAME FOR DELIVERED AND BIDDER'S YARD
P.O. Box 527
Elmira, NY 14902
Phone: 733-5506
Fax: 732-5379

GUIDERAIL

	<u>UNIT</u>	<u>NEW</u>	<u>USED</u>
1. GALVANIZED CORRUGATED W-BEAM GUIDE RAIL AND APPURTENANCES			

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

1.A 12 Gauge Corrugated W-Beam Guide Rail	LF	\$6.36	\$4.64
---	----	--------	--------

STEEL- GALVANIZED RAILING	RFB 1768	EXTENDED FROM 2014
----------------------------------	-----------------	---------------------------

Cont.

EXTRA CHARGE FOR GUIDE RAIL CURVING (ADD THIS TO THE ABOVE PRICES CURVED TO):

1.RC50 50 – 150 ft. radius	LF	\$3.94	N/B
1.RC40 40 – 49 ft. radius	LF	\$3.94	N/B
1.RC30 30 – 39 ft. radius	LF	\$4.07	N/B
1.RC20 20 – 29 ft. radius	LF	\$4.07	N/B
1.RC5 5 – 19 ft. radius	LF	\$4.79	N/B

END WINGS – 12 Gauge

1.B FLARED TYPE	EA	\$35.09	N/B
1.C WRAP-AROUND TYPE	EA	\$39.75	N/B

2. CONCRETE ANCHORS FOR CORRUGATED GUIDE RAIL

2.A W6 X 8.5# 14" LONG WITH SOIL PLATE WITH GALVANIZED BLOCK-OUT AND	EA	\$111.17	N/B
2.B TRIANGULAR GALVANIZED BLOCK OUTS TYPE A, B & C – PRICE PER SET OF THREE	EA	\$139.80	N/B
2.C TERMINAL END SECTIONS GALV. 12'6" GUARD RAIL WITH EXTRA HOLES ON ONE END			
2.C.1 STRAIGHT	EA	\$ 105.34	N/B
2.C.2 DOUBLE TWIST	EA	\$ 164.88	N/B

3. GALVANIZED BOX BEAM GUIDE RAIL AND APPURTENANCES (Unit bid price to include splice hardware)

3.A.12 6" X 6" X 12' in Length	EA	\$291.50	N/B
3.A.18 6" x 6" x 18' in Length	EA	\$371.00	N/B
3.A.24 6" X 6" X 24' in Length	EA	\$459.78	N/B
3.B 6" X 6" CURVE SECTIONS			
205 Foot	LF	\$ 18.82/FT	N/B
20 – 200 Foot	LF	\$ 26.37/FT	N/B
3.C. 6" x 6" BOX BEAM END SECTIONS			
3.C.1 TYPE I	EA	\$327.81	N/B
3.C.2 TYPE II	EA	\$344.93	N/B
3.C.3 TYPE III	EA	\$4,181.84	N/B

4. GALVANIZED I BEAM POSTS

4.A 3"x 5.7# 5'-3" long w/soil plate w/support angle end hardware for box beam	EA	\$59.47	\$37.44
4.B 3" x 5.7# 5'-3" long w/soil plate with hardware for corrugated rail	EA	\$51.14	\$22.98
4.C W6 x 8.5# 5'-6" long Galvanized w/soil plate	EA	\$68.71	N/B
4.D W6 x 8.5# without soil plate	EA	\$48.57	\$23.10

5. BRIDGE AND CULVERT RAIL AND APPURTENANCES (Includes all hardware for erecting rail)

5.A Galvanized 6"x6" Box Beam Rail	LF	\$30.03	N/B
5.B Galvanized Bridge Rail Post with anchor plate, anchor bolts and hardware	EA	\$437.71	N/B

6. INSTALLATION OF RAILING POSTS AND APPURTENANCES (Includes required Labor and Equipment)

LABOR: Unit Bid Prices for providing a minimum of one (1) foreman and (1) helper
EQUIPMENT: Unit and equipment to drive a minimum of 150 posts per day.

6.A Driving Posts – Including Layout	HR	\$249.75	
6.B Driving Posts – Not including Layout	HR	\$249.75	

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

County shall provide a minimum of two (2) men and one (1) truck to assist with the operation.

CLEAR SPAN STEEL ARCH

RFB 1832

Bidder		SteelMaster Buildings LLC 1023 Laskin Rd, Ste 109 Virginia Beach, VA 23451 Phone: 757-422-6800		
Addendum 1				
Item No:	Description	Unit	Est Qty	Unit Price
ARCH-60w	20.FT (H) x 60.FT (Span)	LF	108	\$741.00
		Actual building dimensions BID (19' -6" Clear Height) x (58' -5.3125" Clear Span) Extended BID (Ext Qty x Unit Price) in figures (\$ <u>\$80,028.00</u>) Extended BID in words: Not included		
ARCH-40w	20.FT (H) x 40.FT (Span)	LF	108	\$517.00
		Actual building dimensions BID(19' -0.875" Clear Height) x (38' -3.375" Clear Span) Extended BID (Ext Qty x Unit Price) in figures (\$ <u>\$55,836.00</u>) Extended BID in words: Not included		
ARCH-50w	20.FT (H) x 50.FT (Span)	LF	108	\$674.00
		Actual building dimensions BID (19' -3.25" Clear Height) x (48' -1.6875" Clear Span) Extended BID (Ext Qty x Unit Price) in figures (<u>\$72,792.00</u>) Extended BID in words: Not included		
ARCH-70w	20.FT (H) x 70.FT (Span)	LF	108	\$812.50
		Actual building dimensions BID (19' -7.25" Clear Height) x (68' -5.75" Clear Span) Extended BID (Ext Qty x Unit Price) in figures (<u>\$87,750.00</u>) Extended BID in words: Not included		
ARCH-80w	20.FT (H) x 80.FT (Span)	LF	108	\$1,104.00
		Actual building dimensions BID(19' -8.125" Clear Height) x (78' -6.875" Clear Span) Extended BID (Ext Qty x Unit Price) in figures (<u>\$119,232.00</u>) Extended BID in words: Not included		

NO minimum orders.
 *Unable to meet the specifications.

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

INFRASTRUCTURE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES

RFB 1819

SILVERLINE CONSTRUCTION, INC.

4299 Newtown Road
Burdett, NY 14818
Phone: 546-8289
Fax: 546-2828

LABOR CLASSIFICATION

HOURLY CHARGE

Foreman	No Bid
Journeyman Carpenter	\$80.50
Iron Worker	\$80.00
Laborer	\$74.50
Truck Driver	N/A
Equipment Rigger	\$85.00
Equipment Operator	No Bid
Truck Driver (incl truck rates)	N/A
Equipment Operator (incl equipment rate)	N/A

HEAVY HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT

MOBILIZATION

HOURLY CHARGE

4WD Wheel loader – Case 721B	\$360.00	\$125.00
Track Dozer – Case 850H – Long Haul	\$325.00	\$125.00
Vibrating Drum Highway Roller – Hamm 3307	\$325.00	\$120.00
Vibrating Trench Roller – Dynapac MR700	\$120.00	\$20.00
Track Excavator w/Thumb – Case CX 210C	\$360.00	\$155.00
Track Excavator w/Hammer – Case CX 210B	\$360.00	\$160.00
Telehandler Boom Lift – Case TX 742	\$325.00	\$115.00

HEAVY HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT

MOBILIZATION

HOURLY CHARGE

40 Ton Crane – Grove RT	\$800.00	\$200.00
70 Ton Crane – Terex RT 665	\$900.00	\$245.00
Truck Crane 75 Ton – Grove GMK 5165-2	\$950.00	\$350.00
Truck Crane 160 Ton – Grove 5165-2	\$1,400.00	\$425.00
Motor Grader – Case 863	\$380.00	\$135.00
Tractor Backhoe Loader – Case 580N	\$325.00	\$125.00
Skidsteer 75 HP– Case TR380	\$250.00	\$120.00
Excavator w/Thumb 40 Ton - Grove 350C	\$800.00	\$175.00
Truck Mounted Rail Post Driver - International	\$250.00	\$115.00
Dump Truck 22 T- Kenworth	N/A	\$97.50
Tandem Dump Truck – GMC	N/A	\$88.00
Tractor Trailer & 65 Ton Equipment Trailer - Peterbilt	N/A	\$125.00
Field Truck w/Misc. Tools as per item	N/A	\$25.00

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

PAVEMENT - HOT MIX F.O.B.

RFB 1801

**ELMIRA ROAD
MATERIALS, LLC**
County Road 77A
Horseheads, NY 14845
Phone: 739-7283
Fax: 739-7288

**DALRYMPLE GRAVEL &
CONTRACTING CO., INC. ****
2105 S. Broadway
Pine City, NY 14871
Phone: 737-6200
Fax: 737-1056

(Depends on availability and haul distance from plant)

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>DOT ITEM #</u>	<u>PRICE PER TON</u> <u>F.O.B PLANT 1</u>	<u>PRICE PER TON</u> <u>F.O.B PLANT 1</u>	<u>PRICE PER TON</u> <u>F.O.B PLANT 2</u>
Type 1 Base	403.11	\$57.25/Ton	\$61.00/Ton	\$61.00/Ton
Type 3 Binder	403.13	\$60.00/Ton	\$59.00/Ton	\$59.00/Ton
Type 5 Shim	403.15	\$68.85/Ton	\$72.00/Ton	\$72.00/Ton
Type 6F Top	403.17	\$63.30/Ton	\$67.00/Ton	\$67.00/Ton
Type 7F Top	403.19	\$63.85/Ton	\$68.00/Ton	\$68.00/Ton
Truing & Leveling	403.21	\$63.85/Ton	\$72.00/Ton	\$72.00/Ton
TRK		\$5.50	No Bid	No Bid

**Prices the same for their Plant #3

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

PAVEMENT – HOT MIX (MUNICIPAL)

RFB 1800

Bothar Construction
170 E. Service Rd.
Binghamton, NY 13901
Phone: 723-5012
Fax: 723-4982

Spencer Paving Co.
185 Sabin Road
Spencer, NY 14883
Phone: 589-4466
Fax: 589-6101

1) Hot Mix Asphalt F.O.B. Plant

<u>ITEM/DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>UNIT</u>		<u>Plant #1</u>	<u>Plant #2</u>
1.A HMA-Type 1 Base	TON	\$57.25	\$60.50	\$53.00
1.B HMA-Type 3 Binder	TON	\$60.00	\$62.00	\$54.50
1.C HMA-Type 5 Shim	TON	\$68.35	\$80.00	\$80.00
1.D HMA-Type 6F Top	TON	\$63.30	\$67.50	\$61.50
1.E HMA-Type 7F Top	TON	\$63.85	\$70.50	\$63.00
1.F HMA-Truing& Leveling	TON	\$63.85	\$70.50	\$70.00

Asphalt Costs shall be used in preparation of the project scope and construction cost estimate. Owner shall select materials and plant supply based on the location of the project, plant schedule and materials availability. FOB prices are basis for IN-PLACE pavements.

2) Additional Charge for HMA Placement (Roadways – not including HMA costs)

ITEM 2 DOES NOT INCLUDE HMA – SEE RFB 1801

2.A Paver-Additional for Placement self-propelled Paver with (1) Operator & Screed Man	TON	\$9.50	\$10.50	
2.B Raker – Additional for Raker/Groundman	TON	\$5.00	\$3.25	
2.C Roller – Additional for Compaction	TON	\$8.00	\$4.25	
2.D TRK – Additional for Trucking	TON	\$6.00	\$7.00	
2.E TACK – Tack Coat (Est. -0.80 gal/sy)	GAL	\$8.00	\$8.00	
SUB-TOTAL Items (2.A thru 2.D) Additional unit Bid Price per TON		\$36.50	\$25.00	

3) Miscellaneous Cold Milling HMA (Roadways)

3.A Cold Milling 0" to 3"	SY	\$4.50	\$7.90	
3.B Cold Milling (Mobilization)	LS	\$800.00	\$1,300.00	

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

PAVEMENT – HOT MIX ASPHALT (MUNICIPAL) Cont. RFB 1800

<p>Bothar Construction 170 E. Service Rd. Binghamton, NY 13901 Phone: 723-5012 Fax: 723-4982</p>	<p>Spencer Paving Co. 185 Sabin Road Spencer, NY 14883 Phone: 589-4466 Fax: 589-6101</p>
---	---

**4. In-Place HMA Pavement
(Driveway and Parking Lot – not including HMA costs)**

<p>4.A-HMA - HMA Pavement In-Place. Includes: All labor, Equipment, Tack Coat (each Course), Compaction, Water, MPT, mobilization (0-100 Tons)</p>	TON	\$75.00		\$72.00
<p>4.A-TRK Additional (0-100 Tons) for Trucking</p>	TON	\$6.00		\$6.50
<p>4.B-REPAIRS- Pothole Repairs (Cut & Patch) 60" square, Min. 4" HMA, Min 6" stone backfill (0-500 Square Feet)</p>	SF	\$30.00		\$25.00
<p>4.C-STRIPING Parking Lot Striping (White, yellow or blue lines) (0-5,000 Linear Feet)</p>	LF	\$0.47		\$0.37
<p>4.D-SYMBOLS Parking Lot Symbols Blue ADA Handicap Symbol (0-10 Each)</p>	EA	\$130.00		\$110.00
<p>4.E-SEALING Parking Lot Sealing (includes crack sealing and sealant) (0-10,000 Sq. Yards)</p>	SY	\$3.84		\$3.00

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

PAVEMENT – COLD MIX BITUMINOUS

RFB 1802

SUIT-KOTE CORP.
20 Fairground Lane
Watkins Glen, NY 14891
Phone: 535-2743
Fax: 535-6996

UNIT PRICE PER TON

3.1A. Furnish, mix and place a cold bituminous binder course Type 3.1N per specifications (central pug mill plant)	\$48.33
3.2B. Furnish, mix and place a cold bituminous intermediate course Type 3.2 per specifications (central pug mill plant)	\$53.34
3.3T. Furnish, mix and place a cold bituminous top course Type 3.3 per specifications (central pug mill plant)	\$59.90
3.4 Additional cost for vendor trucking from pug mill plant to project location	\$4.50 0-10 miles \$5.00 10-20 miles \$6.50 20+ miles
4. Furnish, mix and place a cold bituminous binder course per specifications (traveling pug mill paver)	\$47.89

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIALS

RFB 1803

Bidders:	VESTAL ASPHALT 201 Stage Road Vestal, NY 13850 Phone: 785-3393 Fax: 785-3396		SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION 20 Fairground Lane Watkins Glen, NY 14891 Phone: 535-2743 Fax: 535-6996	
	Bid Items:	Heat, Haul, & Apply 15M Gal/Day	Polymer Modified Emulsion Price/ Gallon	Heat, Haul, & Apply 15M Gal/Day
CRS-1 702-4001 Price Adjustment .0030/Gal	\$2.10	\$2.50	\$2.09	\$2.36
CRS-2 702-4101 Price Adjustment .0030/Gal	\$1.928	\$2.328	\$2.12	\$2.37
CMS-2 702-4201 Price Adjustment .0035/Gal	\$2.49	\$2.89	\$2.57	\$2.85
CMS-2H 702-4301 Price Adjustment .0035 / Gal	\$2.49	\$2.89	\$2.55	\$2.83
Tack Coat 702.90 Price Adjustment.0030/Gal	\$9.00	xx	\$7.50	xx
Dust Oil AEP, If Offered Price Adjustment .0030 / Gal	\$1.70	xx	\$1.73	xx
Dust Oil Alternative – Specify Brand Name of Alternative-CDP-40/Mag. Chloride	\$1.05	xx	\$1.15	xx
RS-1 702.3001 Price Adjustment .0025 / Gal	\$2.10	\$2.50	\$1.787	\$2.34
RS-2 702.3101 Price Adjustment .0030/ Gal	\$1.928	\$2.328	\$1.797	\$2.23
HFRS-2 702.3102 Price Adjustment .0035 / Gal	\$1.928	\$2.328	\$1.99	\$2.33
MS-2 702.3201 Price Adjustment .0035 / Gal	\$2.480	\$2.880	\$2.53	\$2.83
HFMS-2H 702.3402 Price Adjustment .0030 / Gal	\$2.480	\$2.880	\$2.40	\$2.80
Additional price per gallon for quantities under 4,500 gallons	xx	\$.25 / gal	xx	\$.30 / gal
Heat, Haul& apply through distributor, mix paver, or pug mill	Cost Per Gallon	\$.200 / gal	Cost Per Gallon	No Charge
Pug mill (only)	Cost Per Gallon	\$.175 / gal	Cost Per Gallon	\$.20 / gal
Mix Paver w / fully automated screed control and hydraulic screen extensions	Cost Per Gallon	\$.400 /gal	Cost Per Gallon	\$.35 / gal
Pug Mill and Auto Paver w/ability to pave 18' in single pass	Cost Per Gallon	\$.350 / gal	Cost Per Gallon	\$.40 / gal
Self-Propelled Aggregate Spreader	Cost Per Gallon	\$.089 / gal	Cost Per Gallon	\$.06 / gal
Distributor rent for use in spray patching (4-hour minimum)	Cost Per Hour	\$150.00 / hr.	Cost Per Hour	\$150.00 / hr.

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

QUICK SET SLURRY SEAL

RFB 1804

VESTAL ASPHALT

201 Stage Road
Vestal, NY 13850
Phone: 785-3393
Fax: 785-3396

PRICE PER S.Y

TYPE II TYPE III

0–14,100 sq. yd. per day	\$1.44/SY	\$1.56/SY
14,101–28,200 sq. yd. per day	\$1.26/SY	\$1.54/SY
28,201–42,300 sq. yd. per day	\$1.23/SY	\$1.54/SY
42,301–56,400 sq. yd. per day	\$1.23/SY	\$1.54/SY

COLD MILLING and MICRO MILLING

RFB 1805

	UNIT	Spencer Paving Co. Inc. Ph: 589-4466	Suit-Kote Corporation Ph: 535-2743	Bothar Construction Inc. Ph: 723-5012	Donegal Construction Ph: 724-423-7500
Type A Cold Milling UPCUT					
Less than 4" Depth of Cut	SY	\$3.15	No Bid	\$0.79	\$1.25
Less than 4" Depth of Cut	DAY	\$15,000.00	No Bid	\$4,700.00	\$8,650.00
Greater than 4" Depth of Cut	SY	\$3.80	No Bid	\$0.79	\$1.95
Greater than 4" Depth of Cut	DAY	\$17,500.00	No Bid	\$4,700.00	\$10,150.00
Type B Cold Milling DOWNCUT					
Less than 4" Thickness	SY	No Bid	\$0.85	\$0.87	No Bid
Less than 4" Thickness	DAY	No Bid	\$5,300.00	\$5,200.00	No Bid
Greater than 4" Thickness	SY	No Bid	\$0.90	\$0.87	No Bid
Greater than 4" Thickness	DAY	No Bid	\$5,600.00	\$5,200.00	No Bid
Type C Micro Milling					
Standard Milling (5/8")	SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.25
FINE Milling (5/16")	SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.85
FINE Milling (5/16")	DAY	No Bid	\$8,500.00	No Bid	\$12,850.00
MICRO Milling	SY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.15
MICRO Milling	DAY	\$5,184.00	\$8,500.00	No Bid	\$14,850.00
Mobilization Skid-Steer Unit	LS	\$500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
identify		S770 Bobcat			
Mobilization Multi-Track Unit	LS	\$800.00	\$500.00	No Bid	
identify		7'2" cutting drum w/ Conveyor	for all Milling Machine Moves		
Water Truck (incl operator)	DAY	\$800.00	\$1,500.00	\$700.00	\$850.00

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

COLD RECLAMATION/RECYCLING OF PAVEMENTS

RFB 1814

SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION

20 Fairground Lane
Watkins Glen, NY 14891
Phone: 535-2743
Fax: 535-6996

VESTAL ASPHALT

201 Stage Road
Vestal, NY 13850
Phone: 785-3393
Fax: 785-3396

TYPE A – Cold in-place reclamation

Type of reclaimer Unit Proposed: CMI /RS-800 ---

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>UNITS</u>		
Less than 4" Depth of Cut	SY	\$0.50	\$0.492
	DAY	\$5,200.00	\$4,500.00
Greater than 4" Depth of Cut	SY	\$0.60	\$0.637
	DAY	5,200.00	\$4,500.00

Stabilizing Agent (Supplied/Applied/Mixed)

CSS-1	GAL	\$1.97	\$1.987
CSS-1H	GAL	\$2.07	\$2.357
SS-1	GAL	\$1.906	\$2.222
SS-1H	GAL	\$1.95	\$2.357
Magnesium Chloride	GAL	\$1.02	No bid
Calcium Chloride	GAL	\$1.09	\$1.07

TYPE B – Cold in-place recycling

Type of Recycling Unit Proposed: ---

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>UNITS</u>		
Less than 3 " Thickness	SY	\$2.21	No bid
	DAY	No bid	No bid
Greater than 3" Thickness	SY	\$2.26	No bid
	DAY	No bid	No bid

Emulsion/Stabilizing Agent (Supplied/Applied/Mixed)

Name: HFMS-2	GAL	\$2.931	No bid
Name: HFMS-2P	GAL	\$3.031	No bid

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

PRECAST DRAINAGE UNITS

RFB 1749

EXTENDED FROM 2014

ZEISER WILBERT VAULT, INC.

750 Howard Street,
Elmira, NY 14904
Phone: 733-0568
Fax: 737-0291

<u>CATCH BASINS</u>	<u>PICKUP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
24" x 24" x 36"	\$360.00/EA	\$385.00/EA
24" x 24" x 48"	\$480.00/EA	\$505.00/EA
24" x 24" x 60"	\$600.00/EA	\$625.00/EA
Additional Vertical LF	\$120.00/EA	\$145.00/EA
24" x 30" x 36"	\$405.00/EA	\$430.00/EA
24" x 30" x 48"	\$540.00/EA	\$565.00/EA
24" x 30" x 60"	\$675.00/EA	\$700.00/EA
Additional Vertical LF	\$135.00/EA	\$160.00/EA

<u>FRAMES/GRATES/COVERS</u>	<u>PICKUP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
SQUARE EACH	\$232.00	\$247.00
ROUND EACH	\$245.00	\$260.00
RECTANGULAR EACH	\$466.00	\$481.00

<u>DRYWELLS (48" ID)</u>	<u>PICKUP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
COVER EA	\$125.00	\$140.00
2' HIGH EA	\$130.00	\$145.00
3' HIGH EA	\$195.00	\$210.00
4' HIGH EA	\$260.00	\$275.00
BASE EA	\$125.00	\$140.00

<u>DRYWELLS (72" ID)</u>	<u>PICKUP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
COVER EA	N/B	N/B
2' HIGH EA	N/B	N/B
3' HIGH EA	N/B	N/B
4' HIGH EA	N/B	N/B
BASE EA	N/B	N/B

<u>DRYWELLS (82" ID)</u>	<u>PICKUP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
COVER EA	\$340.00	\$355.00
2' HIGH EA	N/B	N/B
3' HIGH EA	\$325.00	\$340.00
4' HIGH EA	\$330.00	\$345.00
BASE EA	\$200.00	\$215.00

<u>DRYWELLS (96" ID)</u>	<u>PICKUP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
COVER EA	N/B	N/B
2' HIGH EA	N/B	N/B
3' HIGH EA	N/B	N/B
4' HIGH EA	N/B	N/B
BASE EA	N/B	N/B

<u>RETAINING WALL BLOCKS</u>	<u>PICKUP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
18"Hx24"Wx24"L	\$ 45.00	\$ 55.00
18"Hx24"Wx48"L	\$ 75.00	\$ 85.00
18"Hx24"Wx72"L	\$105.00	\$115.00
Unit Caps	\$20.00 LF	\$25.00 LF

<u>STACKABLE WASTE CONCRETE BLOCKS</u>	<u>PICKUP</u>	<u>DELIVERED</u>
---	----------------------	-------------------------

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

Approx. 24"Hx24"Wx24"L Each	N/B	N/B
Approx. 24"Hx24"Wx48"L Each	N/B	N/B
Approx. 24"Hx24"Wx72"L Each	N/B	N/B
Unit Caps LF	N/B	N/B

PRECAST STRUCTURAL UNITS

RFB 1750

EXTENDED FROM 2014

ZEISER WILBERT VAULT, INC.

750 Howard Street
Elmira, NY 14904
Phone: 733-0568 Fax: 737-0291

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>SIZE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>
BOX.44	4'x4'	\$305.00 LF
BOX.55	5'x5'	\$375.00 LF
BOX.66	6'x6'	\$475.00 LF
BOX.68	6'x8'	\$530.00 LF
BOX.612	6'x12'	\$925.00 LF
BOX.616	6'x16'	\$1195.00 LF
BOX.88	8'x8'	\$632.00 LF
BOX.812	8'x12'	\$876.00 LF
BOX.816	8'x16'	\$1360.00 LF
BOX.820	8'x20'	\$1425.00 LF
BOX.1010	10'x10'	\$865.00 LF
BOX.1014	10'x14'	\$1086.00
BOX.1018	10'x18'	\$1337.00

PRECAST CONCRETE TOE WALL/HEAD WALL UNITS (18"X18"x LF)

BOX-TW1	Toe Wall LF	\$49.00
BOX-HW2	Head Wall LF	\$49.00

PVC IN-LINE DRAINAGE BASINS

RFB 1810

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.

P.O. Box 527
Elmira, NY 14902
Phone: 733-5506
Fax: 732-5379

<u>Product Size</u>	<u>Price Per Each Unit for</u>
<u>For PVC Basins:</u>	<u>Traffic Loadings Including</u>
	<u>Ductile Iron Grate</u>

<u>Diameter</u>	<u>Depth</u>	
12"	24"	\$442.00
12"	30"	\$442.00
12"	36"	\$442.00
18"	30"	\$743.00
18"	36"	\$743.00
18"	48"	\$743.00
24"	48"	\$932.00

In Line Drains:

<u>Diameter</u>	<u>Depth</u>	
18"	4" - 18"	\$459.00
24"	4" - 24"	\$857.00

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

30" 4" - 30" \$1,036.00

ROCK SALT Chemung County will be using the NYS Office of General Services bid for Road Salt Group: 01800

STEEL PLATE AND SHAPES RFB 1798

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP.

P.O. Box 527
Elmira, NY 14905
Phone: 607-733-5506
Fax: 607-732-5379

STRUCTURAL STEEL PLATE AND SHAPES

Price per TON

	(Delivered F.O.B. Destination)	(F.O.B. Vendors Yard)
Steel Plate – A36 60" to 96" by 20 ft.	\$1,600.00	\$1,600.00
Steel Plate – A572 60" to 96" by 20 ft.	\$2,040.00	\$2,040.00
Standard W Shape (Beams) 4" to 12"	\$2140.00	\$2140.00
Standard W Shape (Beams) 14" to 14 x 132	\$1,760.00	\$1760.00
Standard W Shape (Beams) 16" to 36"	\$1,760.00	\$1,760.00
Standard S Shapes (Beams) 3" to 24"	\$2,140.00	\$2,140.00
Standard Channels 3" to 15"	\$1,760.00	\$1,760.00
Miscellaneous Channels 6" to 18"	\$2,160.00	\$2,160.00
Standard Angles 2" x 2" to 6" x 6"	\$1,740.00	\$1,740.00

STEEL REINFORCEMENT

Price per TON

	(Delivered F.O.B. Destination)	(F.O.B. Vendors Yard)
Grade 60- No. 4 bar to No. 8 bar (Black)	\$878.00	\$878.00
Grade 60-No. 4 bar to No. 8 bar (Epoxy Coated)	\$1,600.00	\$160.00
Welded Wire Mesh (10/10) 6x6 – W1.4/1.4	\$1,320.00	\$1,320.00
Welded Wire Mesh (8/8)6x6 – W2.1/2.1	\$1,240.00	\$1,240.00

HEAVY USED MISCELLANEOUS STEEL – PIPE WELDED TO SPECIFIED LENGTH

Bid Price Per Foot – Delivered F.O.B. Destination or F.O.B. Bidder's Yard

<u>Diameter</u>	<u>Wall Thick</u>	<u>Cost</u>
20"	3/8"	N/B
24"	3/8"	N/B
30"	3/8"	N/B
36"	3/8"	N/B
42"	3/8"	N/B
48"	1/2"	\$251.95
60"	1/2"	\$303.18
72"	1/2"	\$352.86
78"	1/2"	\$377.70
84"	1/2"	\$402.54
90"	1/2"	\$426.60
96"	1/2"	\$452.22
108"	1/2"	\$522.15
120"	1/2"	\$571.83
Railroad Rails 70 lbs/yd to 100 lbs/yd		N/B

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

TRAFFIC MARKINGS

RFB 1807 R

SENECA PAVING MARKING

184 Ovid St.
Seneca Falls, NY 13148
(315) 568-5640
(315) 568-5516 (fax)

<u>Bid Item</u>	<u>Est Qty in LF</u>		
A15	2,000,000 (rural) – Single White ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes		0.045
	150,000 (urban) - Single White ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes		0.055
	Extended Total	98,250.000	
B15	1,100,000 (rural) – Single Yellow ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes		0.015
	53,000 (urban) - Single Yellow ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes		0.055
	Extended Total	19,415.000	
C15	2,000,000 (rural) – Double (2) Yellow ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes		0.080
	150,000 (urban) – Double (2) Yellow ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes		0.090
	Extended Total	172,425.000	
D	11,000 – Marking Line Points		0.100
E	2,6000 – Removal of Long Line, 4-inch (ReflectORIZED White/Yellow)		1.500
F.	Total Gross sum bid for Bid Item A-E	\$295,090.00	
G	21,000 LF - Single White ReflectORIZED Pavement Stripes		.75
	White Miscellaneous Markings		
	Extended Total	15,750.00	
H	7,900 LF – Single Yellow ReflectORIZED Pavement Letters		0.75
	Yellow Miscellaneous Markings		
	Extended Total	5,925.00	
I	500 each - White ReflectORIZED Pavement Letters (“SCHOOL”, “STOP”)		35.00
	Extended Total	17,500.00	
J	400 each - White ReflectORIZED Pavement Symbols (arrows & comb. arrows)		35.00
	Extended Total	14,000.00	
K	1,600 LF – Removal of Miscellaneous Markings (Cross Walks, Stop Bars Etc.)		1.50
	Extended Total	2,400.00	
L	50 each- Removal of Letters/Symbols (only, stop, arrows)		10.00
	Extended Total	500.00	
M.	Total Gross sum bid for Bid Item G-L	\$56,075.00	

REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF ANIMAL CARCASSES

RFB 1809

NO BID

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>ITEM # DR-1</u>	<u>REMOVAL & DISPOSAL OF ANIMAL</u>	<u>UNIT</u>	<u>UNIT BID PRICE</u>
---------------	--------------------	---	-------------	-----------------------

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

CARCASSES FROM COUNTY ROADWAYS

EACH

NA

No Response to bid

TREE AND STUMP REMOVAL

RFB 1808

RENKO TREE SERVICE

14 Industrial Park Blvd.
Elmira, NY 14901
Phone: 607-737-0273
Fax: 607-733-1002

A. TREE AND STUMP REMOVAL

CONTRACTOR to remove & dispose of all wood & debris

<u>TOPS:</u>	<u>TREES:</u>	<u>TREES/STUMPS:</u>
Remove tree to below utility line:	Tree removal to stump <u>only</u> :	Tree removal <u>including</u> stump:

<u>TREE SIZE (Dia.)</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>
UP TO 18"	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$675.00
18.1" TO 24"	\$600.00	\$650.00	\$850.00
24.1" TO 30"	\$650.00	\$700.00	\$900.00
30.1" TO 36"	\$850.00	\$900.00	\$1150.00
36.1" TO 42"	\$1250.00	\$1250.00	\$1350.00
42.1" TO 48"	\$1650.00	\$1750.00	\$2100.00
48.1" TO 54"	\$2150.00	\$2250.00	\$2800.00

B. TREE AND STUMP REMOVAL

MUNICIPALITY to pick up & dispose of stacked wood & debris

<u>TOPS:</u>	<u>TREES:</u>	<u>TREES/STUMPS:</u>
Tree removal below utility line:	Tree removal to stump <u>only</u> :	Tree Removal <u>including</u> stump:

<u>TREE SIZE (Dia.)</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>
UP TO 18"	\$400.00	\$475.00	\$675.00
18.1" TO 24"	\$550.00	\$600.00	\$850.00
24.1" TO 30"	\$650.00	\$700.00	\$950.00
30.1" TO 36"	\$750.00	\$850.00	\$1100.00
36.1" TO 42"	\$1200.00	\$1275.00	\$1475.00
42.1" TO 48"	\$1400.00	\$1500.00	\$1800.00
48.1" TO 54"	\$1950.00	\$2200.00	\$2600.00

C. STUMP REMOVAL

CONTRACTOR to remove and dispose of all wood & debris

<u>TREE SIZE (Dia.)</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>
UP TO 18"	\$275.00
18.1" TO 30"	\$375.00
30.1" TO 48"	\$575.00
Larger than 48.1"	\$700.00

D. EMERGENCY WORK – HOURLY RATE

CONTRACTOR to remove & dispose of all wood & debris

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

UNIT PRICE

D1: Emergency Work \$400.00
D2: Trimming & Shaping: \$350.00

RFB- 1830 GEOTEXTILES				
	Chemung Supply		EJ Prescott	
All bid prices are on a "per square yard" basis.				
Tencate Mirafi ID#	Bid Price per sq. yd. -Delivered-	Bid Price per sq. yd. -No delivery-	Bid Price per sq. yd. -Delivered-	Bid Price per sq. yd. -No delivery-
100X (W)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.33	\$0.33
500X (W)	0.38*	0.37*	\$0.45	\$0.45
700X (W)	\$0.61	\$0.60	\$0.60	\$0.60
135N (NW)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.44	\$0.44
140NC (NW)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.52	\$0.52
140N (NW)	0.51*	0.50*	\$0.56	\$0.56
160N (NW)	\$0.62	\$0.61	\$0.72	\$0.72
170 (NW)	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.79	\$0.79
NOTE: W = Woven and NW = Non-Woven				

GEO-GRID (BIAXIAL)				
	Chemung Supply		EJ Prescott	
All bid prices are on a "per square yard" basis.				
Tencate ID#	Bid Price per sq. yd. -Delivered-	Bid Price per sq. yd. -No delivery-	Bid Price per sq. yd. -Delivered-	Bid Price per sq. yd. -No delivery-
BXG10	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.15	\$1.15
BXG11	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.15	\$1.15
BXG12	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.15	\$1.15
BXG110	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.15	\$1.15
BXG120	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.15	\$1.15
*These items are bid as per your request for pricing. Be aware that these items that Chemung Supply bid are <u>not</u> on the NYSDOT approved list nor are the products that you reference for that category. Please refer to the attached document on NYSDOT approved materials by manufacturer.				

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

Chemung Supply RFB-1830

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR GEOTEXTILES

Tencate Mirafi ID#	Bidder's Product Name	Product ID#	Available Width (ft.)	Available Length (ft.)	Area Per Roll (sq. yd.)	Weight Per Roll (lb.)
100X (W)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
500X (W)	Terratex	GS	12 1/2' 17 1/2'	432' 309'	600 600	225 225
700X (W)	Terratex	HD	12 1/2'	360'	500	235
135N (NW)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
140NC (NW)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
140N (NW)	Terratex	N04	12 1/2'	360'	500	160
160N (NW)	Terratex	N06	12 1/2'	360'	500	240
170 (NW)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR GEO-GRID (BIAXIAL)

Tencate ID#	Bidder's Product Name	Available Width	Available Length/Roll
BXG10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BXG11	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BXG12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BXG110	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
BXG120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

EJ Prescott RFB - 1830

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR GEOTEXTILES

Tencate Mirafi ID#	Bidder's Product Name	Product ID#	Available Width (ft.)	Available Length (ft.)	Area Per Roll (sq. yd.)	Weight Per Roll (lb.)
100X (W)	Skaps	W100	3 X 3000	3 X 3000	1000	150 - 300
500X (W)	Skaps	W200	12.5 X 432	12.5 X 432	600	150 - 300
700X (W)	Skaps	W300	12.5 X 360	12.5 X 360	500	150 - 300
135N (NW)	Skaps	GT 131	15 X 360	15 X 360	600	150 - 300
140NC (NW)	Skaps	GT 140	15 X 360	15 X 360	600	150 - 300
140N (NW)	Skaps	GT 142	15 X 360	15 X 360	600	150 - 300
160N (NW)	Skaps	GT 160	15 X 300	15 X 300	500	150 - 300
170 (NW)	Skaps	GT 170	15 X 300	15 X 300	500	150 - 300

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION FOR GEO-GRID (BIAXIAL)

Tencate ID#	Bidder's Product Name	Available Width	Available Length/Roll
BXG10	Tensar TX 130	13	246

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

BXG11	Tensar TX 130	13	246
BXG12	Tensar TX 130	13	246
BXG110	Tensar TX 130	13	246
BXG120	Tensar TX 130	13	246

FLEET BIDS

HIGHWAY FUEL

RFB 1811

STEWART P. WILSON INC

P.O. Box 49
Watkins Glen, NY 14891
Phone: 607-535-6532
Fax: 607-535-9820

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>DESCRIPTION</u>	<u>UNIT</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE DIFFERENTIAL/GAL</u>
1P	Premium Gasoline	GAL	\$0.1675 cents per gallon
2R	Regular (87 Octane) Gasoline	GAL	\$0.1450 cents per gallon
3DS	Summer – Diesel	GAL	\$0.1185 cents per gallon
3DW	Winter – Diesel	GAL	\$0.1260 cents per gallon

FUEL EQUIPMENT AND SERVICE

RFB 1815

BEAVERS PETROLEUM EQUIPMENT CO., INC.

88 B Ridge Road
Horseheads, NY 14845
Phone: 739-1790
Fax: 739-7880

Total for Item Group
\$49,100.00

Bidders		Beavers Petroleum Equip Co Inc.		
Surety		Ck \$500.00		
	Description	UOM	Unit Rate	Sub-Total
1	Technician-Straight Time	120 hrs.	70.00	8,400.00
2	Technician-After Hours	40 hrs.	70.00	2,800.00
3	Technician-Weekend	20 hrs.	70.00	1,400.00
4	Electrician-Straight Time	120 hrs.	75.00	9,000.00
5	Electrician-After Hours	40 hrs.	75.00	3,000.00
6	Electrician-Weekend	20 hrs.	75.00	1,500.00
7	Straight Time Call-Out (in lieu of Travel)	40 calls	15%	23,000.00
8	After Hours Call-Out (in lieu of Travel)	20 calls	0.00	0.00
9	Weekend Hours Call-Out (in lieu of travel)	10 calls	0.00	0.00
10	Parts Mark-up from actual cost	20,000.00	0.00	0.00
TOTAL for Item Group				\$49,100.00
Service hours are based on the following:				
Normal working hours are ___ AM to ___ PM, Monday through Friday			6:00 AM	5:00 PM

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

Weekend hours start on Friday ____PM and end on Monday ____AM	5:00 PM	6:00 AM
(Note: the above listed days and hours do not include Holidays)		

ONE 2015 NEW AND UNUSED DOUBLE DRUM VIBRATORY COMPACTOR

RFB 1816

VANTAGE EQUIPMENT, LLC

5985 Court Street Road
Syracuse, NY 13206
Phone: 315-437-2611
Fax: 315-437-2026

Base Bid

\$109,786.00

Warranty

\$5,489.00

NEW, UNUSED DUMP BODIES, PLOW EQUIPMENT AND SPREADER CONTROLS

RFB 1824

SMART SYSTEMS, INC.

320 E. Washington Street
Bath, NY 14810
Phone: 776-5380
Fax: 776-5383

Gross Bid With Listed Options

\$245,678.00

SUPPLY TIRES AND RELATED TIRE SERVICES

RFB 1656

EXTENDED FROM 2014

PARMENTER Inc.

103 Railroad Street
Odessa, NY 14869
Phone: 594-7106
Fax: 594-7101

Rebid 2016

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

MEDIUM AND HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE REPLACEMENT PARTS

RFB1739

EXTENDED- REBID 2016 (3 yr. Contract)

PRODUCT LINE:
(Bidder may bid on
any or all lines)

COOK BROTHERS
123 Philo Road West
Elmira, NY 14903
Phone: 796-2651
Fax: 796-6193

Beam Mack Sales & Service
3050 Lake Road
Horseheads, NY 14845
Phone: 733-4606
Fax: 733-4824

Point Spring & Driveshaft Co
68 Canton Street
Troy, PA 16947
Phone: 570-297-5555
Fax: 570-297-5510

<p><u>Bid Item A:</u> <u>VMRS Group #01:</u></p> <p>PM Parts Air/Fuel/Oil/Transmission/Hydraulic Filters</p>	<p>50%</p>	<p><u>OEM 38%</u></p> <p>Lubeefiner & Fram 49%</p>	<p>35%</p>
<p><u>Bid Item B:</u> <u>VMRS Group #03:</u></p> <p>Cab Heating, AC, Instrumentation, Wipers</p>	<p>50%</p>	<p><u>OEM 30%</u></p>	<p>35%</p>
<p><u>Bid Item C:</u> <u>VMRS Group #04:</u></p> <p>Chassis, Brakes, Steering, Suspension, Wheels, Bearings</p>	<p>50%</p>	<p><u>OEM 30%</u></p> <p>65%</p>	<p>35%</p>
<p><u>Bid Item D:</u> <u>VMRS Group #05:</u></p> <p>Drive Train, Real Axels, Clutch, Drive Shafts, Auto and Manual Transmission</p>	<p>50%</p>	<p><u>OEM 30%</u></p> <p>55%</p>	<p>35%</p>
<p><u>Bid Item E:</u> <u>VMRS Group #06:</u></p> <p>Electrical Systems Charging, Starting, Ignition, Lighting</p>	<p>50%</p>	<p><u>OEM 30%</u></p> <p>40%</p>	<p>35%</p>
<p><u>Bid Item F:</u> <u>VMRS Group #07:</u></p> <p>Engine, Motor, Air, Cooling, Exhaust, Hard Parts, and Lubrication Systems</p>	<p>50%</p>	<p><u>OEM 30%</u></p>	<p>35%</p>

**CHEMUNG COUNTY, NEW YORK
2015 MATERIAL AND SERVICE BIDS**

rev 7/15/15

<u>Bid Item G:</u> <u>VMRS Group #09:</u>			
Special Application Hydraulics	50%	30%	35%
<u>Bid Item H:</u> <u>VMRS Group #08:</u>			
Specialty Equipment, Tools, Safety Equipment, Flags	50%	30%	35%